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“Nonviolence: The Only Road to Freedom,” Martin Luther King, Jr., May 4, 1966 (excerpts) 
 
. . . I am convinced that for practical as well as moral reasons, nonviolence offers the only road 
to freedom for my people. In violent warfare, one must be prepared to face ruthlessly the fact 
that there will be casualties by the thousands . . .  

Arguments that the American Negro is a part of a world which is two-thirds colored and that 
there will come a day when the oppressed people of color will rise together to throw off the 
yoke of white oppression are at least 50 years away from being relevant . . .  

This is no time for romantic illusions about freedom and empty philosophical debate. This is a 
time for action. What is needed is a strategy for change, a tactical program which will bring the 
Negro into the main stream of American life as quickly as possible. So far, this has only been 
offered by the nonviolent movement. 

Our record of achievement through nonviolent action is already remarkable. The dramatic social 
changes which have been made across the South are unmatched in the annals of history . . . 
Even more remarkable is the fact that this progress occurred with a minimum of human 
sacrifice and loss of life. 

Not a single person has been killed in a nonviolent demonstration . . . 

There are many people who very honestly raise the question of self-defense. This must be 
placed in perspective. It goes without saying that people will protect their homes. This is a right 
guaranteed by the Constitution and respected even in the worst areas of the South. But the 
mere protection of one’s home and person against assault by lawless night riders does not 
provide any positive approach to the fears and conditions which produce violence . . . 

In a nonviolent demonstration, self-defense must be approached from quite another 
perspective. One must remember that the cause of the demonstration is some exploitation or 
form of oppression that has made it necessary for men of courage and good will to demonstrate 
against evil . . . 

It is always amusing to me when a Negro man says that he can’t demonstrate with us because if 
someone hit him he would fight back. Here is a man whose children are being plagued by rats 
and roaches, whose wife is robbed daily at over-priced ghetto food stores, who himself is 
working for about two-thirds the pay of a white person doing a similar job and with similar 
skills, and in spite of all this daily suffering it takes someone spitting on him and calling him a 
nigger to make him want to fight . . . 

I must continue my faith that is too great a burden to bear and that violence, even in self-
defense, creates more problems than it solves. Only a refusal to hate or kill can put an end to 
the chain of violence in the world and lead us toward a community where men can live together 
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without fear. Our goal is to create a beloved community and this will require a qualitative 
change in our souls as well as a quantitative change in our lives . . . 

The American racial revolution has been a revolution to “get in” rather than to overthrow. We 
want a share in the American economy, the housing market, the educational system and the 
social opportunities. The goal itself indicates that a social change in America must be 
nonviolent. 

If one is in search of a better job, it does not help to burn down the factory. If one needs more 
adequate education, shooting the principal will not help, or if housing is the goal, only building 
and construction will produce that end. To destroy anything, person or property, can’t bring us 
closer to the goal that we seek. 

The nonviolent strategy has been to dramatize the evils of our society in such a way that 
pressure is brought to bear against those evils by the forces of good will in the community and 
change is produced . . . 
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